
 

Elizabeth’s Café & Winery 

2006 Annual Auction, Wine Tasting and Wine Sale 

Saturday November 25, 2006 

French Champagne All Champagne Lots 

 FINAL BID$ 4,500.00 
Dampierre Brut Cuvee de Ambassadeurs LIST $50.00 
Perrier-Jouët Grand Brut Champagne LIST $45.00 
Mumm Cordon Rouge LIST $45.00 
Bollinger 1997 Vieilles Vignes Francaises Blanc de Noir Brut LIST $450.00 
Bruno Paillard  Brut Champagne (N.P.U.) Nec Plus Ultra 1990  LIST$290.00  
Krug  Non-Vintage Grand Cuvée Brut Champagne LIST $280.00 
Krug  Champagne Clos de Mesnil 1990 LIST $798.00 
Laurent Perrier  Seicle La Cuve LIST $125.00 
Pol Roger Cuvee Sir Winston Churchil 1995 Brut Champagne LIST $235.00  
Pommery Brut Royal LIST $70.00 
Roederer 1997 Cristal Brut Premier Champagne LIST $260.00  
Salon 1983 Brut Blanc de Blancs Champagne Le Mesnil LIST $225.00 
Salon 1988 Brut Blanc de Blancs Champagne Le Mesnil LIST $225.00 
Salon 1990 Brut Blanc de Blancs Champagne Le Mesnil LIST $290.00 
Salon 1995 Brut Blanc de Blancs Champagne Le Mesnil LIST $290.00 
Taittinger 1995 Blanc de Blancs Comtes de Champagne LIST $240.00 
Veuve Clicquot 1999 Brut Champagne Gold Label LIST $106.00 
Veuve Clicquot 1996 La Grand Dame Brut Champagne LIST $250.00  
Bollinger 1995 Grand Anne Brut Rosé Champagne LIST $180.00 
Bruno Paillard  Brut Champagne Prestige Cuvee LIST $85.00 
Krug Brut Rosé Champagne LIST $390.00 
Nicolas-Feuillatte Brut Rose Champagne LIST $56.00 
Pommery Brut Rose LIST $94.00 
Taittinger Brut Prestige Rosé Champagne LIST $90.00  
Taittinger 1996 Brut Rose Comtes de Champagne LIST $350.00 
Veuve Clicquot Non Vintage Rose Champagne LIST $85.00  
Veuve Clicquot 1995 La Grand Dame  Rose Champagne LIST $500.00  

CALIFORNIA CHARDONNAY 

 FINAL BID $ 430.00 
Abundance Vineyards 1997 Santa Maria Valley Bien  Nacido Chardonnay LIST $67.00 
Au Bon Climat 1998 Sanford & Benedict Vineyard Reserve ChardonnayLIST $55.00 
Beringer Napa Valley Private Reserve 1999 Chardonnay LIST $50.00 
Beringer Napa Valley Private Reserve 2001 Chardonnay LIST $50.00 
2002 Beringer Chardonnay Sbragia Limited Release LIST $69.00 
August Briggs 1999  Leveroni Carneros Chardonnay 
Buchli Station 2003 California Chardonnay 
Clos Pegas 2000 Artist Series Reserve Chardonna 
 Mitsuko’s Vineyard Hommage  LIST $50.00 
DuMol 1998 Sonoma Chardonnay LIST $55.00 
Flowers 2001 Andreen Gale Sonoma Coast Chardonnay  LIST $55.00 
Flowers 2002 Andreen Gale Sonoma Coast Chardonnay  LIST $55.00 
Gainey Vineyard Santa Barbara 2001 Santa Ynez River Chardonnay  LIST $30.00 



CALIFORNIA CHARDONNAY 

 OPENING BID  No bid at $390.00 
Harrison Reserve Napa St. Helena  Chardonnay 2000 LIST $70.00  
Iron Horse 2000 Sonoma Green Valley Chardonnay LIST $44.00  
Jory 1998 Chardonnay “Lion Oaks” Vineyard LIST $52.00   
Jory 1999 Chardonnay “Lion Oaks” Vineyard LIST $52.00  
Keegan 2000 Russian River Chardonnay LIST $56.00 
Lava Cap 1998 Reserve Chardonnay LIST $34.00 
Lolonis 1998 Private Reserve Chardonnay LIST $38.00 
Lolonis 1999 Estate Chardonnay LIST $33.00 
Livingston 1999 Napa Reserve Chardonnay Livingston Moffett LIST $57.00  
Martin Ray 1998 Napa Chardonnay Mariage LIST $33.00  
Mayacamus Vineyards 2000 Chardonnay LIST $34.00 
Mayo Family Vineyard 1997 Estate Bottled Sonoma  Chardonnay “Laurel Hill” LIST $50.00 

CALIFORNIA CHARDONNAY 

 FINAL BID $235.00 
Mer Soleil 2003 Central Coast Barrel Fermented Chardonnay LIST $52.00  
Miner Family Vineyards 1998 Napa Chardonnay LIST $47.00  
Peter McCoy Napa 1997 Chardonnay LIST $ 44.00  
Phelps 1999 Los Carneros Chardonnay  LIST $45.00  
Sebastopol Sonoma County 1999 Chardonnay Dutton Ranch LIST $43.00 
Smith Madrone 2000 Napa Chardonnay LIST $34.00  
Stone Street 1999 Chardonnay LIST $38.00  
Stonegate 1999 Napa Chardonnay  LIST $39.00  
Tobin James 1999 Barrel Fermented Paso Robles   Chardonnay “Radiance”  LIST $28.00  
 
OREGON CHARDONNAY 
 Willamette Valley 

 FINAL BID $275.00 
Argyle 1998 Oregon Willamette Valley “Spirithouse” Chardonnay LIST $47.00 
Argyle 1998 Oregon Willamette Valley “Nuthouse” Chardonnay LIST $47.00  
Adelsheim 2002 Oregon Willamette Valley Chardonnay LIST $31.00 
Chateau Benoit 2001 Oregon Willamette Valley Chardonnay LIST $33.00 
Chehalem 2000 Oregon Chardonnay Willamette Valley Ian’s ReserveLIST $50.00 
Cristom Oregon 1999 ChardonnayLIST $42.00 
Domaine Drouhin Oregon 1997 Chardonnay LIST $55.00  
Domaine Drouhin Oregon 2000 Chardonnay LIST $55.00 
Domaine Drouhin Oregon 2003 Chardonnay Arthur LIST $43.00 
Domaine Drouhin Oregon 2004 Chardonnay Arthur LIST $50.00 
 
Oregon Chardonnay 
 Willamette Valley 

 No Opening Bid at $140.00 
Domaine Serene 1997 Cotê  Sud Vineyard Willamette Valley Chardonnay LIST $53.00 
 Domaine Serene 1999 Clos Du Soleil Willamette Valley Chardonnay LIST $53.00 
Domaine Serene 2001 Clos Du Soleil Willamette Valley Chardonnay LIST $48.00 
Ponzi 2000 Willamette Valley Chardonnay LIST $45.00 
Torii Mor Willamette Valley 1996 ChardonnayLIST $28.00 

Italian Red Wines 

 FINAL BID $340.00 
Angelo Gaja Barbaresco 1998 LIST $295.00 
Falletto di Bruno Giacosa 1999 Barbaresco LIST $150.00 
Toscana Luce della Vite 1997 LIST $99.00 



California Pinot Noir 

 FINAL BID $340.00 
DuMol 2002  Russian River Valley Sonoma County Pinot Noir LIST $95.00 
El Molino Napa Valley Pinot Noir 1998 LIST $85.00 
Fess Parker 2004 Pinot Noir Bien Nacido Vineyard Santa Barbara Central Coast California LIST $69.00   

Flowers 2003 Andreen Gale Sonoma Coast Pinot Noir LIST $80.00  
Optima 1998 Unfiltered Russian River Pinot Noir LIST $69.00 
Optima 1998 Unfiltered Carneros Pinot Noir LIST $69.00 

California Pinot Noir 

 FINAL BID $100.00 
 Solitude 2001 Carneros Pinot Noir Rochioli Vineyard LIST $59.00 
Tandem 2002 California  Pinot Noir Halleck Vineyard LIST $84.00 

Oregon Pinot Noir 

 FINAL BID $250.00 
Archery Summit 2004 Oregon Premium Cuvee Pinot Noir LIST $58.00    
Archery Summit 2002 Oregon Red Hills Pinot Noir LIST $110.00    
Argyle 2004 Oregon Willamette Reserve Pinot Noir LIST $62.00 
Argyle 1999 Oregon Willamette Reserve Pinot Noir LIST $54.00 
Chehalem Oregon Ridgecrest Vineyard 2001 Pinot Noir LIST $64.00   
Cloudline 2005 Oregon Willamette Valley Pinot Noirh LIST $39.00  

Oregon Pinot Noir - Cristom 

 FINAL BID $270.00 
Cristom 2002 Oregon Willamette Valley Jessie Vineyard Pinot Noir LIST $67.00   
Cristom 2002 Oregon Willamette Valley Marjorie Vineyard Pinot Noir  LIST $69.00   
Cristom 2003 Oregon Willamette Valley Louise Vineyard Pinot Noir  LIST $68.00 
Cristom 2003 Oregon Willamette Valley Eileen Vineyard Pinot Noir LIST $60.00 
Cristom 2003 Oregon Willamette Valley Jessie Vineyard Pinot Noir LIST $68.00 
Cristom 2004 Oregon Willamette Valley Mount Jefferson Vineyard Pinot Noir LIST $45.00   

Oregon Pinot Noir 

 FINAL BID $115.00 
Domaine Drouhin 1995 Oregon Pinot Noir  Laurene  MAGNUM LIST $175.00 

Oregon Pinot Noir 

 FINAL BID $105.00 
 Domaine Drouhin Oregon Pinot Noir  1996 “Lauren”  MAGNUM LIST $150.00 

Oregon Pinot Noir 

 FINAL BID $170.00 
Domaine Serene 2002 Oregon Willamette Valley Pinot Noir  Evenstad Reserve LIST $59.00 
IcI/la-Bas 1998 Oregon Pinot Noir “Les Révélés” LIST $53.00 
Roco Wines 2004 Oregon Pinot Noir  Wit’s End Vineyard Yamhill County LIST $75.00 
Ken Wright Cellars 2003 Oregon Pinot Noir McCrone Vineyard LIST $65.00 

Barolo DOC 

FINAL BID $270.00 
2000 Ceretto Barolo Bricco Rocche  Castiglione Falletto, Barolo,  Piedmont, Italy Nebbiolo LIST $295.00 
2000 Ceretto Barolo Brunate Ceretto Brunate, Barolo, Piedmont, Italy Nebbiolo LIST $135.00 



Italian Tuscany 

FINAL BID $400.00 
Ornellaia Le Volte 2003 Tuscany Italy LIST $38.00  
P. Antonori Solaia 2004 Tuscan blend LIST $225.00 
Sette Ponti Oreno 2003 Tuscany, Italy LIST $155.00 
Frescobaldi & Mondavi 2000 Lucente Toscana LIST $42.00 
Villa La Selva Selvamaggio 1997 Red Super Tuscan Table Wine LIST $45.00 
Tenuta Dell Ornellaia 1999 Ornellaia Super Tuscan LIST $200.00  
 

Brunello di Montalcino DOCG 

 FINAL BID $100.00 
Casanova di Neri Tenuta Nuova 1998 Brunello Di  Montalcino LIST $80.00 
2000 Silvio Nardi Brunello di Montalcino  Tuscany, Italy Sangiovese Grosso LIST $84.00 
Sesti 1999 Brunello di Montalcino LIST $90.00 
 
Merlot 
 FINAL BID $200.00 
Duckhorn Vineyards 2001 Napa Valley Howell Mountain Merlot LIST $125.00 
Duckhorn Vineyards 2003 Napa Valley Estate Merlot LIST $133.00 
Duckhorn Vineyards 2003 Napa Valley Merlot LIST $78.00 
 
Merlot 
 FINAL BID $220.00 
Larkmead Family Estate 2002 Napa Merlot LIST $68.00 
Matanzas Creek 2003 Merlot, Bennet Valley, Sonoma LIST $30.00 
Paradigm 1998 Merlot LIST $60.00 
Pine Ridge 2002 Crimson Creek Merlot  LIST $43.00 
Sterling 2001 Reserve Merlot LIST $99.00 
 
Merlot 
 FINAL BID $180.00 
Truchard 1998 Carneros Merlot LIST $45.00 
Truchard 1999 Carneros Merlot LIST $44.00 
Truchard 2000 Carneros Merlot LIST $38.00 
Paradigm 1998 Merlot LIST $60.00 
Twomey 2002 Napa Merlot LIST $97.00 
 
Merlot 
 FINAL BID $160.00 
Canoe Ridge Vineyard 2002 Columbia Washington Merlot LIST $38.00 
Northstar 1999 Columbia Valley Washington 2000 Merlot LIST $80.00 
Woodward Canyon Columbia Valley 2000 Merlot LIST $48.00 
Woodward Canyon Walla Walla Washington  2000 Merlot LIST $65.00 

 
 Rhone Red Wines 
Chateauneuf du Pape  & Cotes-du-Rhône 

 FINAL BID $100.00 
Vieux Telegraphe 2004  Pape Chateauneuf du Pape LIST $80.00  
Delas 1999 Châteauneuf-du-Pape Haute Pierre LIST $50.00 
Château Beaucastle 2002 Couddulet LIST $42.00 

Rhone Red Wines - Hermitage 

 FINAL BID $150.00 
Delas Frères Hermitage Les Bessards 1998 LIST $225.00 



Rhone Red Wines - Hermitage 

 FINAL BID $140.00 
Delas Frères Hermitage Les Bessards 1999 LIST $225.00 
 

Rhone Style Red Wines 

 FINAL BID $29.00 

 Argentina  Syrah 

Luca 2003 Altos de Mendoza Argentina Syrah LIST $39.00 
  
 

California Rhone Style Red Wines 

  No bid at $200.00 

California  Syrah 

Delectus 1998 Mendocino Unfiltered  Syrah LIST $53.00 
Delectus 1999 Mendocino Syrah Terra Alta LIST $51.00 
Qupé 1999 Santa Barbara County, Bien Nacido Reserve Syrah LIST $47.00 
Jory 1998 Lion Oaks Syrah LIST $75.00 
Jory 1999 Santa Clara Valley Lion Oaks Ranch Sangre  de Donohoe Syrah LIST $75.00 
Landmark 2003 Steel Plow Syrah Sonoma Valley LIST  $35.00 
   
California Rhone Style Red Wines 
 FINAL BID $240.00 
Joseph Phelps 2004 Le Mistral  Napa Proprietary Blend LIST $60.00  
Shaefer 2001 “ Relentless”  Syrah LIST $70.00 
Tolosa 2000 Edna Ranch, Edna Valley Syrah LIST $47.00 
Truchard 1996 Syrah LIST $45.00 
Truchard 1999 Syrah LIST $50.00 
Sunstone 1997 Santa Barbara Reserve Syrah LIST $51.00 
 

California Rhone Style Wines - Roussanne 

 FINAL BID  $50.00 
Qupe 1996 Roussanne  LIST $47.00 
Truchard 2000 Roussanne  LIST $47.00 

 

California Zinfandel 
 FINAL BID $365.00 
Downing Family 2002 “Fly by Night” Zinfandel LIST $32.00 
Lolonis 1998 Organically Grown Zinfandel “Tollini”  LIST $50.00 
Niebaum-Coppola  Napa Valley1999 Zinfandel Edizione Pennino  LIST $55.00 
Niebaum-Coppola  Napa Valley2001 Zinfandel Edizione Pennino  LIST $65.00 
Niebaum-Coppola  Napa Valley2003 Zinfandel Edizione Pennino  LIST $55.00 
 Renwood  2000 D’Agostini Brothers Zinfandel LIST $48.00 
Renwood  2000 Jack Rabbit Flat Zinfandel LIST $48.00 
Storybook Mountain Vineyard 2000 Napa Zinfandel – Eastern Exposure LIST $56.00 
   
ITALIAN STYLE RED WINES - Sangiovese 
 FINAL BID $55.00 
Shafer 2002 Firebreak Napa Valley 91% Sangiovese 9% Cabernet Sauvignon  $55.00 
 



California Cabernet Sauvignon 
 NO OPENING BID at $300.00 
Anderson’s Conn Valley 1998 Napa Valley Cabernet  Sauvignon LIST LIST $80.00  
Raymond Burr 1998 Dry Creek Valley Cabernet Sauvignon LISTLIST $50.00 
Cornerstone Cellars 2001 Napa Valley Howell Mountain  Cabernet Sauvignon  LISTLIST $89.00 
Duckhorn Vineyards 2001 Napa Valley Estate Grown Cabernet Sauvignon LISTLIST $130.00 
Gneiss Winery 2000 Napa Valley Cabernet Sauvignon LISTLIST $40.00 
Harrison Napa Reserve Cabernet Sauvignon 1995 LISTLIST $115.00  
 
Meritage Red 
 FINAL BID $340.00 
Araujo 2003 Meritage Red Altagracia LIST $130.00 
David Arthur 1999 Maritaggio LIST $85.00 
Astrale e Terra 2001 Napa Valley Red Meritage “Arcturus”LIST $58.00 
Bacio Divino 1998 Napa Valley Red Table Wine LIST $138.00 
Bacio Divino 2001 Napa Valley Red Table Wine LIST $140.00 
 
California Cabernet Sauvignon 
 FINAL BID $390.00 
Iron Horse 2003 Napa Valley Cabernet Sauvignon T-Bar-T Vineyard LIST $52.00 
Lail 2000 Cabernet Sauvignon J. Daniel Cuvee LIST $114.00 
Lewis Cellars 2003 Reserve Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $184.00 
Château Montelena 1998 Estate Napa Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $150.00 
White Cottage Ranch 2001 Napa Valley Howell Mountain Cabernet Sauvignon “Risa” LIST $67.00 
White Cottage Ranch 2001 Napa Valley Howell Mountain Cabernet Sauvignon  LIST $85.00 
 
California Cabernet Sauvignon 
 FINAL BID $245.00 
Shafer 2002 Napa Valley Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $85.00 
Shannon Ridge 2002 Lake County Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $32.00 
Simi 1997 Alexander Valley Reserve Cabernet  Sauvignon LIST $99.00 
  Simi 2000 Alexander Valley Reserve Cabernet  Sauvignon LIST $45.00 
 Smith-Madrone 1997 Cabernet Sauvignon Napa Valley LIST $56.00 
 
California Red Meritage 
 FINAL BID $390.00 
St. Suprey 1998 Napa Red Meritage LIST $68.00 
St. Suprey 1999 Dollar Hide Ranch Napa Valley Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $98.00 
Swanson 2001 Alexis Napa Valley Meritage LIST $69.00 
Viader Vineyards 2002 Proprietary Red LIST $150.00 
Mount Veeder 2002 Napa Valley Reserve Meritage Red LIST $120.00   
Duckhorn Paraduxx 2003 Napa Valley Red Meritage  LIST $50.00 

Washington Cabernet Sauvignon & Meritage Red 

 FINAL BID $120.00 
Millennium 1995 Washington Red Meritage LIST $145.00 
Chateau Ste Michelle 2003 Cabernet Sauvignon Indian Wells Columbia Valley, Washington  LIST $29.00 
 
Niebaum-Coppola Estate 
 FINAL BID $290.00 
Copolla Family Estate 1998 Napa Valley Rutherford Estate Grown  Cask Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $120.00 
Copolla Family Estate 2001 Napa Valley Rutherford Estate Grown Cask Cabernet  Sauvignon LIST $120.00 
Copolla Family Estate 2002 Napa Valley Rutherford Estate Grown  Cask Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $99.00 



Beaulieu Vineyard 

 FINAL BID $310.00 
Beaulieu Vineyard 1998 BV Georges De Latour Private Reserve Napa Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $ 125.00 
Beaulieu Vineyard 1999 BV Georges De Latour Private Reserve Napa Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $ 125.00 
Beaulieu Vineyard 2001 BV Georges De Latour Private Reserve Napa Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $ 125.00 

Clark-Claudon Vineyards 

 FINAL BID $160.00 
Clark-Claudon Vineyards 2000 Napa Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $150.00 
Clark-Claudon Vineyards 2002 Napa Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $150.00 

Heitz Wine Cellars 

 FINAL BID  $440.00 
Heitz Cabernet Sauvignon Napa Valley Martha’s  Vineyard 1982 LIST $225.00 
Heitz Cabernet Sauvignon Napa Valley Martha’s  Vineyard 1998 LIST $195.00 
Heitz Cabernet Sauvignon Napa Valley Martha’s  Vineyard 1999 LIST $199.00 
Heitz Cabernet Sauvignon Napa Valley Trailside Vineyard 1999 LIST $125.00 

Caymus Vineyards 

 FINAL BID  $470.00 
Caymus Vineyard 2003 Napa Valley Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $99.00  
Caymus Vineyard 1998 Napa Valley Special Select Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $225.00 
Caymus Vineyard 1999 Napa Valley Special Select Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $225.00 
Caymus Vineyard 2000 Napa Valley Special Select Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $185.00 

Diamond Creek 

 no bid at $800.00 
Diamond Creek 2001 Volcanic Hill Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $250.00 
Diamond Creek 2001 Red Rock Terrace Cabernet Sauvignon  LIST $295.00 
Diamond Creek 2001 Gravelly Meadow Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $250.00 
Diamond Creek 2002 Volcanic Hill Cabernet Sauvignon Thirtieth Anniversary LIST $250.00 
Diamond Creek 2002 Gravelly Meadow Cabernet Sauvignon Thirtieth Anniversary  LIST $250.00 
 
Dominus Estate 
 FINAL BID $180.00 
Dominus Estate 1989 Napa Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $225.00 
Dominus Estate 1998 Napa Valley Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $150.00 
 
Far Niente 
 FINAL BID $1200.00 
 Far Niente 1999 Napa Valley Estate Bottled Cabernet Sauvignon 6.0 Liter LIST $1,500.00 
 
Fisher 
 FINAL BID $110.00 
Fisher Coach 1998 Insignia Cabernet Sauvignon   
Fisher 2000 Coach Insignia 
 
Stags Leap Wine Cellars 
 no opening bid at LIST $600.00 
 Stags Leap Wine Cellars 1998 Cask 23 Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $240.00 
Stags Leap Wine Cellars 1999 Cask 23 Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $350.00 
Stags Leap Wine Cellars 1999 Fay Vineyards Cabernet Sauvignon LIST $120.00 
Stags Leap Wine Cellars 1998 S.L.V. Cabernet Sauvignon  LIST $140.00 
Stags Leap Wine Cellars 1999 S.L.V. Cabernet Sauvignon  LIST $200.00 
 



Mondavi 
 FINAL BID $160.00 

 Robert Mondavi 1998 Cabernet Sauvignon Reserve LIST $175.0) 

Mondavi 
 no bid at LIST $300.00 
Robert Mondavi 1998 Cabernet Sauvignon To Kalon Vineyard  LIST $200.00 
Robert Mondavi 2000 Cabernet Sauvignon To Kalon Vineyard LIST $200.00 
 
Opus One 
 FINAL BID $300.00 
Opus One 1999  LIST $190.00 
Opus One 2000 ½ bottle  LIST $98.00 
Opus One 2000  LIST $190.00 
 
Joseph Phelps 
 FINAL BID $400.00 
Joseph Phelps 1998 Insignia Napa Valley – A red Meritage (cabernet sauvignon and merlot)LIST $150.00 
Joseph Phelps 1999 Insignia Napa Valley  LIST $150.00 
Joseph Phelps 2000 Insignia Napa Valley LIST $160.00 
 
Joseph Phelps & St. Jean #1 and #2 Wine’s of the year 
 FINAL BID $280.00 
St. Jean 1999 Sonoma Cabernet Sauvignon Cinq Cepages LIST $149.00 

Number 2 of The Wine Spectator’s top 100 wines released in 2002 
Joseph Phelps 2002 Insignia Napa Valley Magnum (2 bottles) LIST $400.00 
THE WINE SPECTATOR NUMBER ONE WINE OF THE YEAR FOR WINES RELEASED IN 2005. 
 
Silver Oak 
 no bid at 265.00 
Silver Oak 2000  Cabernet Sauvignon Alexander Valley LIST $107.00 
Silver Oak 2001  Cabernet Sauvignon Alexander Valley LIST $95.00 
Silver Oak 2001  Cabernet Sauvignon Napa Valley LIST $155.00 
Twomey 2002 Napa Merlot LIST $97.00 
 
St. Jean 
 FINAL BID $180.00 
St. Jean  2000 Sonoma Cabernet Sauvignon Cinq Cepages LIST $110.00 
St. Jean 2001 Sonoma Cabernet Sauvignon Cinq Cepages  LIST $145.00 
 
PRIVATE SALES AT AUCTION TIME 
HARLAN VERTICAL (7 bottles without 2000) 
 1995 
 1996 
 1997 
 1998 
 1999 
 2001 
 2002 
 FINAL BID PRIVATE SALE $3,500.00 
 
PENFOLDS GRANGE (3 bottles) 
 2001 – 3 bottles 
 FINAL BID PRIVATE SALE $697.00 
 



LEWIS 6 PACK (6 bottles) 
 2002 “ Cuvee L” Cabernet Sauvignon 
 2003 Reserve Cabernet Sauvignon 
 2003 Napa Cabernet Sauvignon 
 2004 Napa Cabernet Sauvignon 
 2004 Napa Chardonnay 
 2005 Sonoma Chardonnay 
 FINAL BID PRIVATE SALE $ 646.00 
 
KATHRYN KENNEDY (1 bottle) 
 1996 Cabernet Sauvignon 
 FINAL BID PRIVATE SALE  $142.00  
 
ORNELLAIA (4 bottles) 
 1999 Tenuta Dell Ornellaia Super Tuscan 
 FINAL BID PRIVATE SALE  $ 636.00 
 
SHAFER HILLSIDE SELECT (2 bottles) 
 2001 
 2002 
  FINAL BID PRIVATE SALE $ 411.00 
 
 
 
PENFOLDS GRANGE (1 bottle) 
 1993 – 1 bottle 
 FINAL BID PRIVATE SALE  $232.50 
 
SHAFER 
 2001 RELENTLESS SYRAH LIST   
 2001 Hillside Select Cabernet Sauvignon LIST   
 2002 Hillside Select Cabernet Sauvignon LIST   
 FINAL BID PRIVATE SALE  $608.00 
 
SALON  
 1995 BRUT BLANC de BLANCS LE MESNIL  
 FINAL BID PRIVATE SALE  $217.00 
 
GAJA 
 1998 ANJELO GAJA BARBARESCO   
 FINAL BID PRIVATE SALE  $196.00 
 
HARLAN 
 1996 HARLAN LIST   
 1999 HARLAN LIST   
 FINAL BID PRIVATE SALE $974.00 
 
ROEDERER  
 1999 CRISTAL BRUT  CHAMPAGNE LIST $250.00 
 Total Price.         LIST $250.00 
 
PETRUS 
 1996 
 1997 
 1998 
 1999 
 2000 
 2001 
 FINAL BID PRIVATE SALE  $7,650.00 


